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Many serious Java programmers, especially enterprise Java programmers, consider the new I/O API--called
NIO for New Input/Output--the most important feature in the 1.4 version of the Java 2 Standard Edition. The
NIO package includes many things that have been missing from previous editions of Java that are critical to
writing high-performance, large-scale applications: improvements in the areas of buffer management,
scalable network and file I/O, character-set support, and regular expression matching. Most of all, it boosts
performance and speed dramatically.Java NIO explores the new I/O capabilities of version 1.4 in detail and
shows you how to put these features to work to greatly improve the efficiency of the Java code you write.
This compact volume examines the typical challenges that Java programmers face with I/O and shows you
how to take advantage of the capabilities of the new I/O features. You?ll learn how to put these tools to work
using examples of common, real-world I/O problems and see how the new features have a direct impact on
responsiveness, scalability, and reliability. The book includes:

A rundown of the new features in NIO●

Basic and advanced I/O Concepts●

Binary I/O and the new buffer classes●

Memory mapped files and file locking●

Character I/O: encoding, decoding and transforming character data●

Regular Expressions and the new java.util.regex package●

Muliplexing with java.nio●

Because the NIO APIs supplement the I/O features of version 1.3, rather than replace them, you'll also learn
when to use new APIs and when the older 1.3 I/O APIs are better suited to your particular application.Java
NIO is for any Java programmer who is interested in learning how to boost I/O performance, but if you're
developing applications where performance is critical, such as game computing or large-scale enterprise
applications, you'll want to give this book a permanent spot on your bookshelf. With the NIO APIs, Java no
longer takes a backseat to any language when it comes to performance. Java NIO will help you realize the
benefits of these exciting new features.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Williams:

As people who live in the modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge to make
all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you actually is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Java Nio is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this
era.

Bonnie Skelton:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or their
friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic inside park.
They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your
own free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday. The first
thing that you ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test look for book, may
be the reserve untitled Java Nio can be excellent book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Daniel Carter:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What
you are related is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books.
One of the books in the top listing in your reading list is usually Java Nio. This book that is qualified as The
Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning into precious person. By looking upwards and review this book
you can get many advantages.

Mary Peterson:

You may get this Java Nio by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your
solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only simply
by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just
looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to
get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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